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The landmark home of retired United States Supreme Court Justice Sandra Day 
O’Connor and the new Center for Civic Discourse at the Carl Hayden Campus for 
Sustainability was relocated to Tempe Papago Park in 2009 through the efforts of a 
grassroots group of civic-minded citizens who enthusiastically endorsed Justice 
O'Connor's wish to re-purpose the house as the "Camp David" of the Southwest.   
 
The property located at 1230 North College Avenue in Tempe Papago Park has been 
nominated for landmark designation and listing in the Tempe Historic Property Register.  
The property is considered eligible for this action by the Historic Preservation Office. 
 
The landmark Sandra Day O’Connor House is significant primarily as the surviving 
property most importantly associated with a life of distinguished public service spent 
building consensus with a style rich in Western pragmatism that has incrementally 
shaped the law, unified a divided Court, and helped a polarized nation coalesce.  Today 
it is difficult to imagine a better personification of the spirit of Arizona than the so-called 
“Daughter of Arizona”, United States Supreme Court Justice Sandra Day O’Connor.  
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RESEARCH  
In accordance with the Tempe Historic Preservation Ordinance, when a nomination for 
historic designation and listing is complete, staff compiles a report and recommends an 
action.  That report will be provided to the commission for use at public hearing to 
inform discussion and enable consideration of historic designation and listing in the 
Tempe Historic Property Register.   
 
The research report at hand provides a preliminary determination of eligibility for use by 
the commission at the 11/04/10 neighborhood meeting to assist in determining if the 
nomination is sufficient for the commission to hold a public hearing.  The neighborhood 
meeting also provides opportunity for neighbors, registered neighborhood and 
homeowner’s association representatives, and other stakeholders to make input and 
exchange information about the proposed designation.  Finally, this research report will 
inform the subsequent public hearing report with respect to initial neighborhood and 
commission concerns and may expedite the public hearing process by providing 
information necessary to thorough consideration of the nomination.1 
 
LOCATION 
The landmark Sandra Day O’Connor House was relocated from its original 1958 site on 
Denton Lane in Paradise Valley to an area in Tempe Papago Park dedicated to the 
development of the Center for Civic Discourse.  Although the Tempe Historic 
Preservation Plan recognizes preservation "in place" as the preferred strategy for the 
long-term management of historic properties, when this is not possible, relocation is a 
recommended alternative to preserve the historic characteristics of the property.2   
 
The opportunity to relocate both the home and the spirit of Sandra Day O’Connor to a 
spectacular setting in Tempe Papago Park resulted from a broad-based community 
effort.  This stunning adobe house has witnessed more than Justice O’Connor’s 
remarkable life journey; for 25 years the home also saw much of the state’s history 
being made.  People got to know one another in this house as they had fun and 
reached compromises across party lines.  In the process, friendships were created that 
helped make Arizona a better place to live.  It is a gift to Tempe and to the community at 
large to let the house serve, once again, as a gathering place where people find the 
level of compromise and consensus needed to move society forward.  Justice O'Connor 
remains committed to promoting civil discussions which translate into effective action 
plans to improve our community.  To this end she offers us her vision for repurposing 
the O’Connor House as a place – “where civil talk leads to civic action.”  The adaptive 
reuse of this property also helps make historic designation after relocation possible.3  
 
The site selected for the relocation overlooks Tempe and the Salt River to the south.  
The home was reconstructed so that it is situated with the same directional orientation 
as it was when first constructed.  We have often heard Mayor Hallman speak about how 
this building has come home because the abode was originally made from sand and 
clay soils from the bed of the Salt River in Tempe.  The new setting was designed by 
Landscape Architect Christy Ten Eyck, one of Arizona's outstanding landscape 
architects.  According to Justice O’Connor, members of the Salt River Pima-Maricopa 
Indian Community blessed the house site in Tempe Papago Park prior to the 
reconstruction.4  
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The National Park Service advises that certain properties, including moved properties, 
are usually not considered for listing in the National Register.  NPS notes however that 
these properties can be eligible if they meet certain requirements, called ‘Criteria 
Considerations,’ in addition to meeting standard eligibility requirements.  NPS provides 
guidelines for determining which properties must meet these special requirements and 
for applying Criteria Considerations.5 
 
The landmark Sandra Day O’Connor House and Center for Civic Discourse is a 
property removed from its original location that remains eligible for historic designation 
under NPS Criteria Consideration B (moved properties).  The property is significant 
primarily as the singular surviving property most importantly associated with an historic 
person – retired United States Supreme Court Justice Sandra Day O’Connor.6   
 
Throughout the 1970s, when Justice O'Connor served in the Arizona legislature and as 
Senate majority leader, her home provided a forum for many amicable resolutions to 
heated political discussions. "I remember sessions in the living room area," Justice 
O'Connor recalled, "talking about provisions for Arizona that would keep us out of debt 
but [encourage] progress."  Now, as the ‘Center for Civic Discourse,’ the house will once 
again serve as a forum for exploring problems in such areas as healthcare, women's 
justice, civic education, and the preservation of the Western landscape and its fragile 
cultural and natural resources.7 
 
CONDITION 
The present owner acquired the Paradise Valley property planning to demolish the 
house and build a larger dwelling.  Impending demolition was the impetus for moving 
the house.  Beginning late in 2007, the landmark Sandra Day O’Connor House was 
carefully moved, with each adobe block numbered, stacked on pallets, and covered with 
tarps.  Roof sections and structural framing were trucked in large assemblies and 
reinstalled using heavy equipment.  The total relocation process used more than $2 
million in private funding.  This community-based activity preserved the historic building 
to provide meeting space and pay tribute to Justice O’Connor and her family.  In 2009, 
the landmark Sandra Day O’Connor House and Center for Civic Discourse was 
reconstructed in the same orientation in which it formerly existed within the boundaries 
of the Carl Hayden Campus for Sustainability at Tempe Papago Park.  With assistance 
from the private nonprofit Rio Salado Foundation, this property provides a first-class 
meeting facility in one of the most unique desert settings in the Valley metro area.   
 
AGE 
Although the process for local designation closely follows National Register protocol, we 
must make a distinction at this juncture for the landmark definition.  The Landmark 
designation provided by the Tempe Historic Preservation Ordinance relates specifically 
to the age of a property.  By Tempe Ordinance; Landmark means a designation, in the 
form of overlay zoning, applied to an individual property, as a result of formal adoption 
by the city council, which has achieved significance within the past fifty (50) years and 
which expresses a distinctive character worthy of preservation and which otherwise 
fulfills or exceeds the criteria for designation as an historic property.8 
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Although Justice O’Connor lived in this home with her husband and three children from 
1958-1981, the 2009 relocation of the building to Tempe Papago Park effectively resets 
the clock.  Today the landmark Sandra Day O’Connor House and Center for Civic 
Discourse is proposed for designation under the landmark provision of the Tempe 
Historic Preservation Ordinance as a property which has achieved significance within 
the past fifty (50) years.9 
 
SIGNIFICANCE  
Former Supreme Court Justice Sandra Day O’Connor is one of Arizona’s most 
recognizable and influential public figures.  Appointed in 1969 to the Arizona Senate 
and re-elected twice afterward, O'Connor became majority leader in 1972, the first 
woman to hold that title in the country.  Precedent was set again in 1981, when she 
became the first woman justice to serve on the United States Supreme Court.  At the 
time of her Federal appointment she had held office in all three branches of Arizona 
government, another important precedent as she remains the only person to have done 
so.  Having served for twenty-four years as the Supreme Court’s first female justice, 
Sandra Day O’Connor enjoys widespread recognition.  Perhaps her most prestigious 
award, however, came on August 12, 2009, when she received the Presidential Medal 
of Freedom, America’s highest civilian honor.  Today it is difficult to imagine a better 
personification of the spirit of Arizona and the Desert Southwest than the “Daughter of 
Arizona”, Justice Sandra Day O’Connor.10 
 
A moved property significant under Criteria A or B must be the surviving property most 
importantly associated with a particular historic event or an important aspect of an 
historic person's life.  The phrase "most importantly associated" means that it must be 
the single surviving property that is most closely associated with the event or with the 
part of the person's life for which he or she is historically significant.  In the early 1970s 
and through 1981, when Justice O'Connor served in the Arizona legislature and as 
Senate majority leader, her home provided a forum for many heated discussions and 
amicable resolutions.  The house provided the setting for significant bipartisan growth 
and development during the Arizona’s formative years.  Today, as the Center for Civic 
Discourse, the house will once again serve as a forum to explore problems in such 
areas as healthcare, women's justice, civic education, and the preservation of the 
Western landscape and its fragile resources.11 
 
INTEGRITY 
Integrity is the ability of a property to convey its significance.  To be designated historic 
a property must not only have historic significance; it must also maintain sufficient 
integrity to communicate that significance to persons unfamiliar with the property or with 
the community in general.  A candidate property is evaluated according to seven 
aspects of integrity which must be present in different combinations depending on the 
property type and the criteria from which historic significance is derived.  The seven 
aspects of integrity are; Location, Design, Setting, Materials, Workmanship, Feeling, 
and Association.  In practice, all aspects of integrity are not normally present in an 
historic property therefore determining which must exist for a particular nomination 
requires knowing why, where, and when the property is significant.12  
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For the case at hand, the landmark Sandra Day O’Connor House and Center for Civic 
Discourse is significant as a building property type under NPS Criteria B, based on its 
association with the life of person significant in the history of the community; it is also 
representative of some great ideal of the community, bipartisan consensus building for 
social progress.  Under this eligibility scenario, the property obtains significance at the 
regional (Arizona) level if it can be found to maintain four of the seven aspects of 
integrity.  Specifically, our subject property must maintain integrity of Setting, Materials, 
Feeling, and Association in order to convey its significance.13   
 
Accordingly, our discussion will be limited to discovery of those aspects of integrity only, 
and, out of respect for commissioners’ time, will not consider the aspects of Location, 
Design, and Workmanship, although two of these other aspects also adequately exist.  
As seen in the following discussion, the property exceeds minimum requirements and 
retains more than adequate integrity to qualify for designation and listing.14   
 
Setting – Moved properties considered for eligibility under Criterion B must continue to 
have an orientation, setting, and general environment that are comparable to those of 
the historic location and that are compatible with the property's significance.   In the 
context of integrity, NPS defines Setting as the physical environment of a historic 
property.  Whereas location refers to the specific place where a property was built or an 
event occurred, setting refers to the character of the place in which the property played 
its historical role.  It involves how, not just where, the property is situated and its 
relationship to surrounding features and open space.15  
 
Now located at the Carl Hayden Campus for Sustainability, the house shares a "green" 
theme with its neighbors: the Xeriscape Garden of the Tempe Women's Club; Evelyn 
Hallman Park; and the Eisendrath Center for Water Conservation.  The house continues 
to enjoy a setting of undisturbed Sonoran Desert habitat much as it did in its original 
location.  Moved from a residential neighborhood of one-acre lots to an area of just 
lightly less than one acre, local architect D. K. Taylor's green philosophy has been 
preserved in the directional alignment, which has been precisely retained.  As the west 
wall takes the brunt of the sun, floor-to-ceiling windows are located on the east and 
large overhangs shade exterior walls.  The natural environment remains integral as an 
adjacent riparian area called the Green Line Overlook; it is home to cottonwoods, 
African sumacs, California fan palms as well as varied wildlife.  The house blends into 
the trees, and is appropriate to the environment:  not a showcase, but an organic part of 
the landscape.16 
 
The landmark Sandra Day O’Connor House and Center for Civic Discourse is now fully 
reconstructed in the orientation in which it was first constructed.  Now located at the 
Carl Hayden Campus for Sustainability, the house again enjoys a “carefully crafted and 
unobtrusive setting that reflects the nature of its surroundings.”  Along with neighboring 
structures in the campus, the O’Connor house illustrates a “green” theme, emphasizing 
the historic structures’ traditional passive approach to desert climate control and 
sustainability in the modern era.  As Tempe Mayor Hugh Hallman has noted while 
reflecting on the beauty of the desert house and the work politicians of his generation 
have ahead: "It looks like it belongs here, it will stand as an icon not just for the woman 
who made it famous but for the progress we need to make for this state to survive." 17 18 
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Materials – In the context of integrity, NPS defines Materials as the physical elements 
that were combined or deposited during a particular period of time in a particular pattern 
or configuration to form an historic property.  The choice and combination of materials 
reveal the preferences of those who created the property and indicate the availability of 
particular types of materials and technologies.  Indigenous materials are often the focus 
of regional building traditions and thereby help define an area's sense of time and place.  
A property must retain key exterior materials dating from the period of its historic 
significance.  If the property has been rehabilitated, the historic materials and significant 
features must have been preserved.19 
 
Integrity of materials determines whether or not an authentic historic resource still 
exists.  The family built their Arizona home in 1958 in Paradise Valley.  The adobe 
bricks were made of mud from the Salt River in Tempe.  The O'Connor House continues 
to epitomize this environmentally respectful Southwestern tradition, with its eco-friendly 
adobe blocks made from the soil of the nearby Salt River.  Molded and baked in the 
sun, the mud bricks harden into a durable building material excellent for insulation, 
especially with additional soil applied as mortar between the bricks.   
 
During the 1957 construction, Sandra and John helped gather soil and form the adobe 
bricks.  The O’Connor’s played an important role in the actual construction of the house 
as well, helping to place the adobe bricks and fill the gaps with adobe mortar.  Once the 
walls were complete, the couple coated them with skim milk as a protective measure.  
“John and I hand-scraped every one of those indentations in the adobe ourselves,” 
O’Connor recalls.  With their hands-on involvement, this home came to reflect not only a 
love of desert materials and landscapes but also Justice O’Connor’s unique spirit and 
perspective on law, politics and society.  The home afforded a comfortable relaxing 
setting where people and ideas came together to make Arizona a better place.  “When 
the house is moved, I will help to paint the walls once again with skim milk, just like 
John and I did years ago.”20 
 
In designing the narrow, elongated house, local architect D. K. Taylor incorporated the 
influences of Frank Lloyd Wright and Cliff May.  As early as 1929, artists and architects 
began to flock to the southwest.  One of the most influential was Frank Lloyd Wright 
who purchased land in Scottsdale in 1937 for what would become Taliesen West.  The 
presence of Wright and later the Taliesen West School of Architecture created a strong 
modern influence in Arizona.  About the same time, California architect Cliff May was 
beginning to experiment with what would ultimately develop into his lasting legacy – the 
suburban Post-war "dream home" the California Ranch House.  In a site-specific 
synthesis of these styles, Taylor included large roof overhangs to protect the adobe 
bricks from the unforgiving Arizona sun.  He also used large floor-to-ceiling windows, 
which created the illusion that the outside existed inside.  Taylor used a minimal palette 
of materials that gives the home both a modern and a Southwestern sensibility.  
Nowhere is this more apparent than with the free-standing adobe fireplace. Its location, 
in the middle of an open-plan living room, is very modern, but the adobe brick gives it 
the look of a traditional hearth.  Throughout the house, the adobe brick is exposed, and 
along with the natural wood structure and red concrete floors, gives the home a rugged 
feel.  In the end, Taylor elegantly achieved what the clients asked for which was to 
recreate the memories of Sandra’s childhood adobe home on a ranch in Duncan, 
Arizona.21   
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Feeling – In the context of integrity, NPS defines Feeling as a property's expression of 
the aesthetic or historic sense of a particular period of time.  It results from the presence 
of physical features that, taken together, convey the property's historic character. For 
example, a rural historic district retaining original design, materials, workmanship, and 
setting will relate the feeling of agricultural life in the 19th century.  A grouping of 
prehistoric petroglyphs, unmarred by graffiti and intrusions and located on its original 
isolated bluff, can evoke a sense of tribal spiritual life. 22   
 
In May 2008, with Mayor Hallman's encouragement, Tempe City Council voted 
unanimously to relocate the O'Connor house to land adjacent to the Arizona Historical 
Society Museum in Papago Park.   Fifty years before the move, when the time came to 
build a home in the Phoenix area, the young couple picked a place where Praying Monk 
and Camelback Mountain were visible, and where the Sonoran Desert and the quiet 
were all encompassing.  While the original site took advantage of the picturesque 
Praying Monk formation on Camelback Mountain, the new location opens up to the 
majestic Four Peaks in the McDowell Mountains in an expansive panorama similar to 
the previous site.  From the unique beauty of its red rock buttes to the refreshing waters 
of its urban lake, Rio Salado and the Tempe Papago Park region offers a rich array of 
cultural, historic, natural and recreational resources.  Here the natural environment 
remains integral to the site of the Center for Civic Discourse.  Overflow from the nearby 
North Tempe Water Treatment Plant feeds an adjacent riparian area called the Green 
Line Overlook, is home a diversity of desert plants and wildlife.  Here in its new location 
man and nature coexist in harmony and imbue the setting with a feeling of nurturing and 
wellbeing just as it was fifty years ago down on Denton Lane.23 
 
Association – In the context of integrity, NPS defines Association as the direct link 
between an important historic event or person and an historic property.  A property 
retains integrity of association if it is the place where the event or activity occurred and if 
it is sufficiently intact to convey that relationship.  Like feeling, association requires the 
presence of physical features that convey a property's historic character.  Because 
feeling and association depend on individual perceptions, their retention alone is never 
sufficient to support eligibility of a property for the National Register.24 
 
The O’Connor family's home became part of Arizona's history.  As it happened, the 
house was also the site for numerous moments at the kitchen table, on the patio, and 
across the cooking area, where international guests chatted, legislators hammered out 
differences and where an Arizona lawyer was vetted for her selection as the nation’s 
first woman Supreme Court Justice.  Not only did the adobe walls embrace history, they 
often broke down barriers across party lines.   
 
Justice Sandra Day O’Connor recalls these events with pleasure; "The years I was in 
the Senate we would host gatherings at the house for the senators," she said, recalling 
the times when disputed Senate bills were drafted in the home's cozy Southwestern 
ambiance. "I would fix chalupas and Mexican food and all the trimmings.   I remember 
sessions in the living room area with various leaders in the community talking about 
provisions for Arizona that would keep it out of debt but allow progress to be made.  The 
state department would often send young leaders from around the world to Arizona to 
see the Grand Canyon, and John and I would have them over for dinner. We'd talk 
about each other's countries and how the world would be a better place if we knew 
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more about each other.  We would have senators from both sides of the aisle," she said. 
"When you enjoy each other's company that way you are less apt to be terribly partisan 
and difficult and when you're back at work - it makes a huge difference."25 
 
The home’s floor plan performed exactly as John and Sandra hoped it would, facilitating 
and inviting discussion while food was prepared.  Justice O’Connor was an avid cook 
and baker.  Amidst the open plan she was part of everything even while in the kitchen.  
In addition, significant events shaped people who visited, as well as Arizona legislation.   
Leo Corbet, former President of the Arizona State Senate, says: “Through the years that 
I served with Sandra, I used to marvel at her ability to go from Senate Majority Leader to 
gracious hostess with such ease. She would have the full Senate over for dinner within 
hours of debating legislation and never miss a beat.  We wrote the Grand Jury bill on 
her kitchen table while she was baking cookies for one of her son’s school events.  She 
was always able to master both roles and do justice to both.”  To this day, Justice 
O’Connor believes that it is critical for politicians to make friends on both sides of the 
aisle and she remains concerned about the divisiveness of partisanship at any level of 
government.26 
 
Arguably the most historic events occurred in the house in 1981, when President 
Ronald Reagan fulfilled his promise to appoint the first woman justice to serve on the 
United States Supreme Court.  Justice O’Connor was visited at home by Washington 
officials there to administer the high-level job interview.  Shortly thereafter and once 
again at home, the President called to tell her he planned to announce her appointment 
as Associate Justice.  In his remarks announcing his intention to nominate her the 
President said “She is truly a person for all seasons, possessing those unique qualities 
of temperament, fairness, intellectual capacity, and devotion to the public good which 
have characterized the 101 brethren who have preceded her.  I commend her to you, 
and I urge the Senate's swift bipartisan confirmation so that as soon as possible she 
may take her seat on the Court and her place in history.”27 
 
And so we mark the end of the family’s association with the house that started some 25 
years prior with a commitment to public service that would grow and continue to evolve 
until it would ultimately help define the very law of the land.  From humble beginnings as 
a community activist to a career that would make her “the first woman on the court and 
thus the most powerful woman in the United States”, Justice Sandra Day O’Connor 
personified the honesty, the integrity, the very spirit itself of Arizona and the American 
Southwest.28 
 
Finally, we are fortunate to also have an opinion of eligibility available from the Arizona 
State Historic Preservation Officer that addresses continued eligibility of the property in 
consideration of relocation.  According to Jim Garrison, the design of the house borrows 
from the styles of nationally renowned architects Frank Lloyd Wright and Cliff May.  
Garrison has reviewed the house's eligibility listing in the National Register of Historic 
Places, and has provided HPO with a preliminary opinion of eligibility under Criteria B 
and C at the regional (State) level of significance based on the successful repurposing 
of the house as a mediation center rather than a museum memorializing her life.29 
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HISTORIC CONTEXT 
Women in Arizona Politics, 1969 – 1981  
On a local and statewide level, Sandra Day O’Connor represents perhaps the most 
influential woman politician and public servant in Arizona history.  At a time when few 
women rose to positions of prominence in politics, she proved that precedent to be one 
in dire need of amendment, subsequently rising to a position on America’s highest court 
and paving the way for future women politicians.  Prior to achieving that distinction, 
however, Sandra Day O’Connor used Arizona as a venue for her meteoric rise, in the 
process fostering bipartisan cooperation and promulgating innumerable important 
pieces of legislation in some of Arizona’s most important developmental years, the 
1960s and 1970s.  In her many important accomplishments, O’Connor served as a 
trailblazer for future women; she embodies the beginning of a nationwide proliferation in 
the role of women in politics. 
 
Sandra Day was born on March 26, 1930 to Harry Alfred Day and Ada Mae Wilkey in El 
Paso, Texas and subsequently grew up on a ranch near Duncan, Arizona.  She would 
spend a considerable amount of time in her early life in El Paso; she lived with her 
grandmother while attending school, and graduated sixth in her class from El Paso’s 
Austin High School in 1946.  Later, along with her brother, she would co-author a book 
about her early life entitled “Lazy B:  Growing up on a Cattle Ranch in the American 
Southwest.” 
 
After high school, she attended Stanford University where she received a bachelor’s 
degree in economics in 1950.  She went on to attend Stanford Law School, serving on 
the staff of the Stanford Law Review, the presiding editor-in chief of which was future 
Chief Justice William Rehnquist.  As in interesting aside, the two briefly dated while at 
Stanford; scarcely could they have imagined they would one day serve together on the 
United States Supreme Court.  When they graduated in 1952, Rehnquist was ranked 
first in the class and Sandra Day was ranked third.   
 
On December 20, 1952, she was married to John Jay O’Connor, and they had three 
sons:  Scott, Brian, and Jay.  After completing her studies at Stanford, she had difficulty 
finding employment with law firms in California, and turned instead to a position as San 
Mateo County’s deputy attorney, in which position she served until 1953. 
 
O’Connor’s career in Arizona began shortly thereafter, when she returned to the 
Phoenix area with her husband and began her legal career.  After moving to Phoenix, 
she continued to have difficulty finding work because “no one would hire a female 
attorney.”  Consequently, she opened her own private practice in Maryvale, and, along 
with a partner, practiced landlord-tenant law, handled domestic relations cases, and 
occasionally represented indigent defendants.  As a young female attorney, her rise in 
prominence would be gradual at first, initially receiving appointments to public offices at 
the local and county levels. 
 
Ultimately, O’Connor was forced to put her career on hold when her babysitter quit and 
she became a stay-at-home mom for several years.  Once her children reached school 
age, she was able to continue her career.   
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By the late 1960s, O’Connor’s rare ability resulted in an almost meteoric rise to 
prominence.  Serving first as Arizona’s attorney general from 1965-1969, she was 
subsequently appointed to the Arizona State Senate in 1969 by Governor Jack Richard 
Williams, a position to which she would be reelected twice.  In 1973, she served as the 
State Senate’s Republican majority leader, making her the first woman in the country to 
hold that position at the state level.  Remaining in the Phoenix area, O’Connor was 
elected to serve as a judge on the Maricopa County Superior Court in 1975.  She 
continued that service until 1979 when she was appointed to the Arizona Court of 
Appeals by Democratic Governor Bruce Babbitt.   
 
During her time in the state senate, from 1969-1975, O’Connor became well known for 
her ability to negotiate bipartisan cooperation on important policy initiatives, using her 
home as an informal setting for achieving political compromise.  Although the original 
three-bedroom home was only 1,700 square feet, it served as an excellent place for 
informal gatherings with important political leaders.  The O’Connors hosted innumerable 
get-togethers there, including local, national and even international personages.  There 
was plenty of room for friends to congregate in the great room, on the large patio, or 
around the fire pit.  They even used their large outdoor patio as a dance floor on many 
occasions.30 
 
O’Connor fondly remembers her Paradise Valley home for its role as a venue for 
“compromise and collaboration with both sides of the aisle.”  O’Connor herself writes 
that, “I regularly invited Republican and Democratic legislators over to my house to talk 
about issues facing Arizona. Over dinner, we would discuss ideas and options in a 
collegial, civil manner.  We did not worry about party politics because we focused on 
working together to reach solutions to the problems facing us.”31 
 
A former member of the Arizona State Senate recalled that, “She would have the full 
Senate over for dinner within hours of debating legislation and never miss a beat.  We 
wrote the Grand Jury bill on her kitchen table while she was baking cookies for one of 
her son’s school events.  She was always able to master both roles and do justice to 
both.”  Her children, although young at the time, recall numerous foreign diplomats 
visiting the house as well. 32 
 
By the time she was appointed by President Ronald Reagan to serve as the first-ever 
female Supreme Court justice in 1981, O’Connor had already held office in all three 
branches of Arizona’s government, making her the only person ever to do so.  As the 
first female ever appointed to America’s high court, O’Connor broke a tradition of 192 
years and 101 consecutive male justices.   
 
O’Connor’s appointment to the United States Supreme Court in 1981 thus represents a 
clear transition in her career from the local and state level to the national stage.  Her 
Paradise Valley home served as her residence for the entirety of her two-and-a-half 
decades in Arizona and therefore it is this time period, 1958-1981, that serves as the 
historic context with which this property is most closely associated.  However, it is 
important to also note her subsequent achievements on the national scale; it is her 
status as the first woman on the Supreme Court that catapulted her to such a high level 
of prominence as a public figure. 
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On July 7, 1981, President Ronald Reagan appointed O’Connor to replace Justice 
Potter Stewart on the United States Supreme Court.  She recalls her initial skepticism 
about accepting the appointment because her former Stanford classmate, William 
Rehnquist, was already serving on the court and feared this might be perceived as a 
conflict of interest.  However, she ultimately accepted the appointment, making her the 
first woman to serve on the Supreme Court.  In his diary, President Reagan recorded 
the circumstances around which O’Connor accepted, noting that he “called Judge 
O’Connor [today] and told her she was my nominee…already the flak is starting, and 
from my own supporters… [but] I think she’ll make a good justice.” 
 
Her nomination was opposed primarily by anti-abortion advocates because of her 
previous voting records upholding pro-abortion statutes. “Right to Life people say she is 
pro-abortion,” President Reagan wrote; but, “she says abortion is personally repugnant 
to her.”   Despite the misgivings of the pro-life community, O’Connor was confirmed by 
the U.S. Senate on September 21, 1981, by a unanimous vote of 99-0.  She would 
remain the first and only woman to serve on the Supreme Court until 1993, when Ruth 
Bader Ginsburg was appointed as her colleague. 
 
While on the Supreme Court, O’Connor, a Republican, most frequently voted along the 
same lines as William Rehnquist, at times voting with him on as many as 93.4 percent 
of decisions.  Even so, she would come to be considered the court’s leading centrist, 
oftentimes casting swing votes on important decisions.  Despite her pronounced lean 
towards the Conservative side, she is often considered to have been the most open-
minded justice on the court during her tenure.  Her role in casting critical swing votes 
made her the most powerful justice on the court for many years. 
  
On July 1, 2005, O'Connor announced her retirement plans.  In her letter of resignation 
to President George W. Bush, she stated that her retirement from active service would 
take effect upon his nomination, and the Senate’s confirmation, of her successor.  
Accordingly, she was replaced by Samuel Alito on January 31, 2006, after serving 24 
terms on the court.   
 
Following her retirement, O’Connor stated that she would have preferred to follow the 
Supreme Court justice precedent of remaining on the court until “too ill to continue,” but 
cited her husband’s poor health (he was suffering from Alzheimer’s, and would die three 
years later, in 2009) as her reason for stepping down. 
 
As a retired Supreme Court Justice, O’Connor is now entitled to a full salary, maintains 
a staffed office, and hears cases on a part-time basis as a visiting judge on the 9th U.S. 
Circuit Court of Appeals.  Among dozens of other honorary positions, she currently 
serves as Chancellor of The College of William & Mary and on the board of trustees of 
the National Constitution Center in Philadelphia.  At Yale University’s 305th 
commencement on May 22, 2006, O’Connor was awarded an honorary doctoral degree.  
Perhaps her most prestigious award, however, came on August 12, 2009, when she 
was awarded the Presidential Medal of Freedom, America’s highest civilian honor.   
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On a local level, Sandra Day O’Connor has likewise received innumerable awards and 
honors.  The federal courthouse in Phoenix, dedicated in 2000, is named after her, as is 
Arizona State University’s law school, which was renamed for her on April 5, 2006.  Her 
former home, originally built in Paradise Valley and moved to Papago Park in Tempe, 
has become an icon of preservation and now bears the name “O’Connor House and 
Center for Civic Discourse.”  The house, in its present state, serves as a perpetual 
manifestation of the remarkable career of Sandra Day O’Connor.33 
 
The historic Sandra Day O’Connor House is significant for its close association with the 
personal life and professional career of this remarkably influential individual.  As a 
lawmaker and public figure, O’Connor played an important role in the development of 
Arizona during some of its most formative years, between 1958 and 1981.  The house 
provided a venue for innumerable gatherings of public officials, and many important 
compromises and discussions occurred within the confines of its walls.  The home has 
historically provided a congenial environment for political discourse, which is 
perpetuated in its modern relocation and designation as the “Center for Civic 
Discourse.” 34 
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